NATIONAL COMPANY LAW APPELLATE TRIBUNAL, NEW DELHI
Company Appeal (AT) (Insolvency) No. 1090 of 2019

IN THE MATTER OF:

Suman Chakraborty ...Appellant
Vs
Anhui Technology Imp. & Exp. Co. Ltd. ....Respondent
Present:

For Appellant: Mr. Abhigyan Choudhury and Mr. Ateendra Saumya

Singh, Advocates.

For Respondent: Mr. Pranav Chadha, Mr. Arvind Kumar Gupta and
Ms. Henna George, Advocates for R-1.

Mr. Amit Bhatnagar and Mr. Gautam Singhal,
Advocates for IRP.

ORDER

07.01.2020: Pursuant to application under Section 9 of the Insolvency and
Bankruptcy Code, 2016 (hereinafter referred to as I&B Code’) filed by ‘Anhui
Technology Imp. & Exp. Co. Ltd.” (Operational Creditor) Corporate Insolvency
Resolution Process having initiated by the Adjudicating Authority (National
Company Law Tribunal), New Delhi by impugned order dated 19t September,
2019 against ‘M/s Pantel Technologies Pvt. Ltd.” (Corporate Debtor), same is

under challenge on the ground that there was a pre-existing dispute.

2. Learned counsel appearing on behalf of the Appellant — Shareholder
referred to email dated 30th September, 2016 and other documents to suggest
that faulty materials were supplied by the Operational Creditor, which reads as

follows:-



wsR01e Zenbra
Zimbra suman@pantel.in
FW: TRC report of 83AAQ1
From : Suman Chakraborty <suman@pantel.in> Fri, Sep 30, 2016 05:37 AM
Subject : FW: TRC report of 83AAQ1 *1 attachment

To : 'Eva’ <sales2@wh-elec.com>

Cc : 'Pantel' <manoj@pantel.in>, 'Mukesh
Karnataka' <mk@pantel.in>, 'Pantel Vijender
Singh' <md@pantel.in>, ‘avinash sati'
<avinash.sati@pantel.in>, 'liyushu' <lys@wh-
elec.com>, 'ken' <ken@wh-elec.com>, 'Ge
Feng' <gefeng2728@163.com>, 'ge.feng'
<ge.feng@pantel.in>, 'PSPL Production'
<production@psplindia.com>

Dear Eva
Please find attached assembly / production report of WH385 ( 83AAQ1 )

We got 886 pcs faulty out of 2620 nos. of kit. We repaired 859 nos at our
die before dispatching the material.

You can check eva the fault ration overall for this unit is approx. 33%.
What is this 77?777 this is not acceptable at all. We consumed buffer gty as
well as all spare parts also to rectify faulty units.

The detailed fault list that we regorked is attached along with this mail
for you reference.

Again we are saying to keep your QC process more stronger . how we can
accept this kind of fault ration in new goods and our rework is waste of
time and money.

Need replacement parts which we kept separate at our factory

Suman

---—--0riginal Message-----

From: Videsh Swami [mailto:videsh.swami@psplindia.com]

Sent: 30 September 2016 10:02

To: Mukesh Karnataka <mk@pantel.in>; Suman Chakraborty <suman@pantel.in>;

mail pantel InVzimbratprinimessage?ideC 67448 11

»
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3. On the other hand according to learned counsel appearing on behalf of the

Respondent (Operational Creditor) by Letter of Guarantee dated 14t February,

2017, the Corporate Debtor confirmed payment without any objection and delay,

which is as follows:-

. '/_’ w. Inlotyponiol iy w. v g idal
( \ G LIZ23000L201 0P TCILT 404
| 1 , /
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B LETTER OF GUARANTEE
Cated |)4" Fub 2017
Cormm— s
| To,
ANFILITACTINOLOGUY IMPEIXI GO LD
ASOWINTCHANCIIIANG HOAT,I TEVELCTIINA
i
Suo) Guas! for the repay L of A payable to  ANKILI
TECHNOLOAY IMP&EXP CO.LTD
7
" w- Noredy oorfirm thal  Pentel Teohnalogy Pvi Lid will pay Amount w ANHLUI
5 .l:'c‘:.u»:‘r:\gt.yuv IMPEEXT COLLTD se por Mulual understanding snd as per botow
' vosipay PSRN - -
’ Invole [
' Involce "°.___ I ”.“' ""'?:,:'g"“’“ Paymant Dete
& el {lodlAols | _S4ANA0 [ Trensferr TTapen DRSO
LALEANDITEASS | 29.00.2036 | 196,080.85 Jumm.mmz:_mm_:
AILOAN3I74030 | 281302036 | 220,108.31 | Tronefer by TY as on 20™ May 2017 |
| AJIGANSIY432 | 28.11.2016 142,555 00 kil ¥’ AR
AJIBAN32Y4940 | 28.31,2038 168,275.70 Tranafor by TT as on 18" July 2017
AJIGANS27444) | 01.22,2016 301,229.71 Trunsfer by TT s an 25" 17
Above mention payments are delay due 1o demanetipation by the Govt, of India and we ure
unabia v sale Gut tness goods due 1o Cash orunch In the merket.
Now wa are hate by confirm that pa nlwamdlwlhouoﬂuloncmw ohuil not delay
the payment, nur sholl we oppose Il for eny resson whatsoever. We shall [nform you In wriling us
400N we paymont hes boen made.
! .
A - .
PHNTEL TECHNOLOGIES PUT. LTD.

Offiet
T fathoreb3, Neldo (U7 INDIA « 201301
T+ 202594900

-~
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4. Reliance has also been placed by learned counsel for the Respondent on

Letter dated 10th July, 2017 to support that the Corporate Debtor was ready to

pay the dues, as extracted below:-

e.nfo@pantelin w, www.pantd.

@\ . | /Anﬂexunﬂ- A 112

e Tha Piture. o o

July 10, 2037

fn,
KAV Law Astochates

104, Vocket -1 Jasole

o INew Dednl «110025 :
Aaforanca 1+ Your Intter ref.no 4625/31023/A/¥7/02/01 dated 30 June 2017 received on 6%
July 2017 regarding Anlwl Techinology Imp. & B Co, Ltd

Subject i+ Repayment of amount payable ta Anhul Yackaology Imp. & Exp. Co. Ltd

Maam/Sr, :
Ihefer to your sbove mentionad lutter we #ccept the due amount of USD 950,681.27 (m Nine
Laiihs Wingty Thousand $ix Hundred Elghty One Md Twanty Seven Cent Only)

Cue to bad rarket condition our rates procerds could not reakized yot and somé of the goods
are stil laying in our h as un sald | y. You or your client may visit aur warehouse

and lnspoct the laying goods . &

Furthar It mr client is ‘ready to tack back the lmventory at olr warshouse we wlll send back to
them or mnah! to any cther as per there advises.

Wae faced lot of problem In the mstecial llad by your cllent as quality and short supply of
spares . We have send the several malls 1o Wel Heng Oigital Company Limited In this regards,
Due 1o liquidity problem we hae Aot fulfil our commitment/guarantes given to your chent M/s
Anhul Tachnology imp. & xp, Co. Ltd on 16" Feb 2017,

Q We have long business relationiiip with your client and require some more time for reallzation
of money from our venders. We are fivan our bast effort to nquldiu the unsold Inventory
Q laying at our warehouse ; R

.
/@?«

v

'Ml"l Tw“ﬂlﬂﬂm PUT. I:m. ‘
uj’ o 03, Ml (UsR) SOIA- o s :m,gcdw
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5. Another email dated 18t July, 2017 has been cited by learned counsel for

the Respondent, which is as follows:-

A”n m’ re- A . / L,
Fromn : Mang) Tyagh <manc)® pantssins
Sonty 18 July 2017 1829
Yo logal@kplewassoclatescom; kumar@kplawassosiates.com , , 5
Ce! © md@pentalin santosh kulnar
Subject; In the Matter of Anhui Technotogy Imp. & Exp.Co. Lid

Attachmants Leter to K&P on 10 july 2017 .docx

‘6“ erence 1= Your letter refino 4625/31423/A/17/01/01 dated 30™ June 2017 recelved on
’
July 2017 regasding Anhul{Technology lmp, & Exp, Co, Lud

Subject - Repayment of amount payable to Anhui Technology Imp. & Exp. Co, Ltd

Madsr/Sir,
Refer to your above menticned etier We aocept the due amount of USD 990,681.27 (USD Nine
Lakhs Ninsty Thousand Six Hundred Elghty One and Twenty Seven Cent Only)

Due'to Mmmmuonowwummlpwwmm”tm same of the goods are
still leying [n our warehouse us un sold hvmmy You or your cllent may visit oue warehouss
and faspect the laying goods . '

LA |

.. +  Purther if your client Is ready to tack bdck the laventory nt owr wazehouse we will send back 1o
them or transfer to any other es per there advisey, |
~ | ; : |
Wathoodlé\?tprobhminthomumeppuodbyywcuwuqunutylad short supply of {
speres . We have'send the several mails to Wel Heng Digital Company Limited ln this regards.
Due to liquidity problem we had not fulfll] our comenltmenv/guarantes glven to your olient
M/s Ashul Technology Imp. & Exp. Co, Lud on 14% Feb 2017,
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6. From the record we find that the demand notice under Section 8(1) was
issued by the Operational Creditor on 10t June, 2017, the email dated 30th
September, 2016 (as quoted above) is much prior to demand notice, which shows
that quality material was not supplied and it was substandard. Though by letter
dated 14th February, 2017, the Corporate Debtor has said that they will make
payment but letter dated 10th July, 2017 shows that sales proceeds could not be
realized by the Corporate Debtor because they faced lot of problems in the

material supplied by the Operational Creditor for bad quality and short supply.

7. Submission made by learned counsel for the Respondent — Operational
Creditor that the Corporate Debtor admitted the claim, cannot be adjudicated by
the Adjudicating Authority in an application under Section 9 of I&B Code as it
cannot decide the claim or counter claim being not Court of competent
jurisdiction. It is required to be seen that prior to issuance of demand notice

under Section 8(1) is there any dispute.

8. In the present case there being a pre-existing dispute relating to quality of
product supplied by the Operational Creditor referred in the email dated 30tk
September, 2016, the Adjudicating Authority without deciding the issue whether
it was accepted to pay the amount or not is not competent to admit application

under Section 9, there being a pre-existing dispute.
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9. For the reason aforesaid we set aside the impugned order dated 19th
September, 2019 and dismiss the application under Section 9 filed by the
Respondent — Operational Creditor. The Corporate Debtor is released from the
rigour of Corporate Insolvency Resolution Process and will function through its
Promoters and Directors. The Interim Resolution Professional will hand over the
assets and records to the Promoter/ Directors immediately. The case is remitted
to the Adjudicating Authority to decide the fee and cost incurred by the Interim
Resolution Professional and to decide about the person who will pay the amount,
preferably within three weeks. The appeal is allowed with aforesaid observations

and directions. No costs.

[Justice S. J. Mukhopadhaya]
Chairperson

[Justice Bansi Lal Bhat]
Member (Judicial)
am/gc
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